
 
 
 
 
Monday, September 16 

 
We acknowledge the original inhabitants of this area, the sduhubš* people, and their 
successors, the Tulalip Tribes. Since time immemorial, they have hunted, fished, gathered 
on, and taken care of these lands and waters. We respect their sovereignty, their right to self-
determination, and honor their sacred spiritual connection with the land and water. In 
Everett Public Schools, we strive to create equitable outcomes and build a culture of 
inclusive belonging for all students, teachers, staff, and community. 
 
 

 

• Hi Seagulls!! Have you voted for the homecoming theme yet? Make sure you're voting by 
THIS TUESDAY!!! You can vote via email. So, check your emails right now and make sure 
to vote! 

• Hello Seagulls! Everett High Drama and Thespian Society's DRAMAFEST one act play 
festival is coming up in November! Our auditions are on October 1st! We have audition 
packets and crew applications outside A126! Come to our first Thespian Society meeting in 
the Little Theatre, Tuesday September 17th to meet the directors, our officers, advisor Sara 
Coiley, and get all the details! 

• Hello Gamers!  Gaming Club is back!  Our first meeting is today after school in Room S-
102.  Activity bus passes available.  Game on! 

• Are you interested in health science? Do you want to participate in the blood drive and 
other volunteer work? If so, stop by E-204 this Tuesday for our first official HOSA 
meeting! Snacks will be included. 

• BSU Meeting on Tuesday September 17th 2:15 in Mr. Ellis's Room A-124. 

• Hey, Seagulls!  Are you interested in starting a new club this year that isn't already offered 
at Everett High? Do it NOW so it can be put into the next student council meeting, which 
will be on October 1st, and, if you submit soon enough, you can participate in this year's 
Club Fair on September 26th! 

• Get ready to *fall* in love with Latinos Unidos! Our first meeting is Wednesday, 
September 18th at 2:10 after school in Room C110. We’ve got *concha-lations* for showing 
up—delicious conchas, hot chocolate, games, and all the *cozy* vibes. Don’t be *chai*—see 
you there! 

• Are you interested in engineering, production, fashion design, or anything in between? 
Technology student association also known as TSA is the club for you: grow your skills and 
compete in a variety of events if this sounds like fun drop by our first meeting after school 
today in the library.  

• Reminder that doors will lock 5 minutes into each period.  If you are late to class you will 
need to check in at the main building in order to be let into class. During lunches the main 
building will be the only building unlocked. The 3rd floor will be closed during both 
lunches, but you can go to the library after you have eaten.    

 
Today in sports 

• Volleyball at Glacier Peak at 7:00 

• Girls soccer vs Oak Harbor at Lincoln Field at 7:00 

• Boys tennis at Marysville Getchell at 3:30 
 
Pledge of Allegiance 
I pledge allegiance to the flag of the United States of America, and to the republic for which it 
stands, one nation under God, indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 
 

 
MAKE IT A GREAT DAY EVERETT HIGH, THE CHOICE IS YOURS! 


